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香港賽馬會獎學金 - 職業教育獎學金
得獎同學分享專業發展路
Hong Kong Jockey Club Scholarship Awardees 
exchange views at sharing session

2022年度「香港賽馬會職業教育獎學金」分享會於2022
年9月1日在跑馬地快活看台順利舉行。香港賽馬會慈善
事務高級經理（藝術、文化、保育及人才發展）葉巧兒女士
勉勵得獎同學繼續努力，追尋理想，將來回饋社會。應邀
擔任演講嘉賓的「社職」共同創辦人及營運總監黃景龍
先生，分享他創辦科技企業 - 「社職」的歷程和經驗，並鼓
勵學生在困難時保持毅力，以同理心建設關愛社會。

兩位往屆得獎同學也分享了他們把握新機遇的經驗，其
中陳潔儀同學分享了她在藝術方面的發展以及去年在
瑞士巴塞爾藝術展上展出的作品。馮冠倫同學則分享了
他轉行的經驗和心路歷程。最後職業訓練局機構拓展處
處長顏淑賢女士致辭，對香港賽馬會的慷慨解囊表示衷
心的感謝，並鼓勵同學為社會作出貢獻。自2016/17年至
今，獎學金已資助逾80名青年學院職專文憑畢業生升讀
高級文憑課程，以及資助共18名VTC高級文憑畢業生，
赴笈海外修讀有關飛機工程、海事科技、環境工程、建築、
設計或旅遊款待等學士學位課程。

“The Hong Kong Jockey Club Scholarships - Vocational 
Education Scholarship Awardee Sharing Session 
2022” was held successfully on 1 September 2022 at 
the Happy Valley Stand, Happy Valley Racecourse. Ms 
Winnie Yip, Executive Manager, Charities (Grant 
Making – Arts, Culture, Heritage and Talent 
Development) of The Hong Kong Jockey Club, 
encouraged students to pursue their dreams with 
passion and step up to serve our communities. Mr 
Antony Wong, Co-founder and Chief Operating Officer 
of Social Career, was invited as a guest speaker to 
share his journey and experience in founding the tech 
venture, Social Career, and to encourage students to 
stay perseverance during tough time and be 
empathetic to build a caring society.

Two alumni scholarship awardees also shared their 
experience of grasping new opportunities. Ms Kristin 
Chan shared her personal development in art and work 
presented in Art Basel in Switzerland last year. Mr Allen 
Fung shared his experience of career change. Ms 
Winnie Ngan, Director of the Institutional Advancement 
Office of VTC, expressed her sincere gratitude for the 
generosity of the Hong Kong Jockey Club and 
encouraged students to contribute to the development 
of Hong Kong. Since 2016/17, the Hong Kong Jockey 
Club Scholarships have supported more than 80 
graduates from the Diploma of Vocational Education to 
pursue further studies at Higher Diploma and also 18 
graduates of Higher Diploma to pursue further studies 
at overseas degree programmes in the fields of 
Aerospace, Marine, Environmental, Architecture, 
Design and Hospitality.


